
 
WARNING:  TODDLERS AND CHILDREN CAN FIT THROUGH PET DOORS AND 
MAY ESCAPE OUTSIDE UNATTENDED.  
 
*Now you have purchased your pet door and you'll have to decide whether you're going to install it yourself or have 
someone do it for you.  Proper installation is a prerequisite for the weather tight seal. If you're very handy, self-installation 
is the cheapest way to go. But if you're not, the extra cost of having your dog door professionally installed may be well 
worth the convenience, as well as peace of mind in knowing it's done properly and securely.   
 

Freedom Pet Pass Suggested Wall Mount Installation Guidelines and Tips: 
Please read before Installing! (Install video online)   

www.energyefficientdogdoors.com 
 
Note:  There are devices available to help verify wall stud location and utilities (wires and plumbing) prior to cutting a 
hole in your wall in the desired location. 
 
This Freedom Pet Pass does not include a “tunnel kit”. The cavity in the wall created when adding additional framing to 
attach our pet door to the exterior side of the exterior wall will create a box in the wall that can be finished off to 
complement the other windows or doors  in that room. 
  
Creating the rough opening in the wall with a 2”x4”, 6” or 8” wall studs is necessary for any wall mounted pet door 
application. Without the additional framing in many applications the interior dry wall will have no support and would be 
subject to damage if pressure is applied where framing is absent. 
 
Locating the pet flap opening in the wall for an ergonomically correct or pet friendly access is very important. Dogs and 
Cats should not have to Crouch or Jump to pass thru the flap system. 
 
For pet doors with a security panel they are easily accessed from the interior side of the wall it is attached too, recessed 
into the interior wall opening for a discreet look. 
 
The Security Panel is not meant to be used to lock your pet outside with. Your Pets will not see the barrier on the other 
side of the flap system and attempt to claw or chew their way back into their “den”. 
 
If a wider wall thickness begins to become a tunnel or obstacle when the pet door is raised in the wall for the size of pets it 
is to service, a narrower threshold should be considered. Develop a walk in opening (from floor to top of the pet door 
rough opening in the wall from the inside of your home to narrow up the threshold leading to the outside.  
 
The outside ground level and inside floor level should be the same on either side of the pet door location. 
 
Install the pet door (raise it up in the wall) so that the top of pet opening in the Vinyl frame is at least 1 ½” higher than the 
tallest pet at the shoulders in your pack. This will eliminate your bigger pets from crouching to pass thru the flap system. 
 
A step added to either side of the flap system, one in the cavity of the wall on the inside and one on the outside of the wall, 
will allow the shorter pets to step up and thru. 
 
The dry wall opening on the inside of the wall cavity should only be opened up to the rough opening for the size pet door 
to be installed allowing for appropriate trim to be added.  Finish the interior and exterior of the (tunnel) opening similar to 
your existing doors or windows for your finished custom application. 
 
Please view wall mount video for tips on how to add the additional wood frame inside wall cavity without over sizing the 
dry wall on the inside or siding on the outside.    
 
Build the frame in square and level for best results. Use the rough opening dimensions suggested for the size of pet door 
that is to be installed. The rough opening suggested for each size will allow ¾” overlap of our vinyl frame to the exterior 
face of the wood frame and allow ¾” overlap of the exterior envelope siding material. The vinyl frame of the pet door 
should be recessed into the envelope (siding, stucco ect.) of the exterior wall and securely attached to the frame members 
with appropriate fasteners (screws or nails).  



 
Seal the exterior and interior with caulk or sealant appropriate for your geographical location. Apply a proper water shed 
(i.e.: J channel for vinyl siding) to the exterior side. This suggested application of the Freedom Pet Pass will prevent the 
outdoor environment from entering into the wall cavity of your home. 
   
As with all fenestration applications correctly sealing out the elements on the exterior side of your home is very important. 
 
If you do not feel comfortable installing a wall mount dog door including building a box and framing it to your home we 
suggest asking a handy friend or hiring a licensed contractor to install this custom application for you.   
 

Freedom Pet Pass Do’s and Do not’s 
 
Do not use the security panel to lock your pets out. Damage to the flap system may occur from dogs with a strong 
desire to re-enter their home. 
 
Do not allow leashed pets to pass through the dog door. The leash can tangle up in the flap system. 
 
Do not force your dog through the pet flap when training it to use the pet door. This will shy them away even more from 
using it. 
 
Do lift and temporarily tie the outside black U shaped flap seal up out of the way using a string. This will introduce their 
new access location in a simpler way. To encourage your pet to use the dog door, reward with treats and praise. After they 
have become familiar with the new passage remove the string and allow the magnetic seal to provide comfort to your 
home. 
 
Do not rely solely on the chew guard to prevent a mischievous pet from chewing the magnetically lined jam.  The chew 
guard simply reduces the damage a pet may cause. 
 
Do use a powerful anti-chewing product to completely prevent a mischievous pet from chewing. Dried ground Habanera 
pepper sprinkled sparingly in a smudge of Vaseline and applied to the inside of the black flap seal between the magnets 
has proven to help. Consult with your veterinarian first before applying. 
 
Do remove debris from magnets with a dry rag once a month for optimal sealing. 
 
Do use a non-detergent cleanser (Woolite) and a soft scrub brush to remove dirt from the canvas coated pet flap.  
 
Do not allow children to use the dog door.   
 
Do expect an energy-efficient seal and a happy pet if you follow these simple instructions. 

Pet Door Training Tips 

Finally, you have your new pet door installed! However, your pet will not instantly know what it is, or how to use it. You 
may have to teach them how. Be prepared for it to take some time. Many pets learn to use pet doors within a very short 
time. But others, especially timid or anxious dogs, might take a little longer. Be patient, don't rush it, don’t over train 
(short sessions two or three times a day at most) and above all don't force your pet to pass thru, This will shy them away 
even more from using it. 
 
The traditional method of training a pet to use a pet door is really just a matter of showing the pet the door opening, slowly 
opening the flap when someone else calls the pet from the opposite side of the opening enticing them to pass through it. Of 
course, when they do come through, reward them with a treat, and spend a few minutes petting and playing with them 
before repeating the exercise. Many pets will catch on in just a few minutes. Others will take a day or two. For the slower 
learners, lift and temporarily tie the outside black U shaped flap seal up out of the way using a string. This will introduce 
their new access location in a simpler way. To encourage your pet to use the dog door, reward with treats and praise. After 
they have become familiar with the new passage remove the string and allow the magnetic flap seal to provide comfort to 
your home. 
 

 
 
 
 
 


